
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Wildlife Wednesdays with FOCRG 

 

Coal Tit 

 

 

This little bird has a distinctive grey 
back and black cap, with a slender bill 
well adapted to feeding in conifers. It is 
also a fan of peanut feeders in 
gardens. Although it is spotted less 
often than some of our other tits, there 
are a few residing in the Rec!  
 

Chaffinch 

 

After the Wren, the Chaffinch is the 
most common bird that breeds in the 
UK. It loves to munch on insects and 
seeds. They can be found along the 
woodland paths around the Rec, and 
with their loud call you will often hear 
them before you see them. While the 
male has a bold rosy chest, the female 
is brown, both however have the 
distinctive white flash on the wings that 
you will spot as they flit away.  
 

Goldfinch 

 

Perhaps the most splendid finch -
though the Chaffinch and Bullfinch will 
disagree - the Goldfinch is easily 
identifiable with a bright red face and 
yellow wing patch. It is often in sociable 
groups, so if you see one in the Rec, 
keep an eye out for more!  
 

 


